
 

Student College Representative Volunteer Role Profile 

BANT Lead BANT Student Network Team Lead 

Team / Project / 
Workstream 

The Student Network is an evergreen programme to support 
and engage current and future BANT student members, help 
them develop a community and support network, and ensure 
that they feel a connection with BANT during their study. 

BANT College Student Representatives are a key 
approachable point of contact within each year group/class at 
each college, receiving feedback and offering advice and 
signposting to BANT resources for all student members. 

BANT Student College Representatives will liaise with the 
BANT Student Council Representative, who represents BANT 
students on BANT Council ensuring the student voice is heard. 

The BANT Student Council Rep will keep the BANT Student 
College Reps up to date with relevant information and the 
latest developments. 

Key 
Deliverables 

● Create and sustain positive active relationships with 
training provider faculty and students 

● Grow awareness and appreciation of BANT with the 
student body and keep BANT aware of the key issues & 
interests most important to the students 

Activities 

● Actively disseminate relevant BANT information within 
each year group of the internal college social media forums 

● Feedback any queries from the students to the BANT 
Student Rep 

● Attend monthly meetings with the BANT Student Rep either 
in person or on-line- usually 1st Monday in Month at 12-1 
pm 

Features & 
Benefits 

● Within your community you will become a recognised and 
trusted expert for the role of BANT in supporting and 
promoting the profession 

● You will develop familiarity with the issues and interests 
most important to students and through your relationships 
with faculty and BANT have the ability to highlight these to 
those able to act upon them 



 

Knowledge, 
Skills, 
Experience, 
Competencies 

● Energy & enthusiasm for the role 
● Confident communicator, verbal, written & virtual 
● Understanding of relevant college points of contact & 

communication channels available to communicate with 
students 

● Familiarity and readiness to make use of relevant 
engagement channels e.g. internal college forums, 
WhatsApp, LinkedIn, Facebook, Twitter, etc. 

Commitments 
Needed 

● Up to 2 hours per week, with significant flexibility to avoid 
conflict with peak course demand times e.g. assignment 
deadlines 

● At least one year in the role, in order to ensure opportunity 
to build the essential relationships among faculty and 
students 

● Attend monthly meetings with the BANT Student Rep either 
in person or online, usually 1st Monday in Month between 
1200 to 1300 
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